

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	1 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

Per Nebraska's Transparency in Government Procurement Act, DAS is required to collect statistical information regarding the number of contracts awarded to Nebraska contractors. This information is for statistical purposes only and will not be considered for contract award purposes.

NEBRASKA CONTRACTOR AFFIDAVIT: Bidder hereby attests that bidder is a Nebraska Contractor. "Nebraska Contractor" shall mean any bidder who has maintained a bona fide place of business and at least one employee within this state for at least the six (6) months immediately preceding the posting date of this ITB.

I hereby certify that I am a Resident disabled veteran or business located in a designated enterprise zone in accordance with Neb. Rev. Stat. §73-107 and wish to have preference, if applicable, considered in the award of this contract.

Contract to supply and deliver Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel and Surfacing Gravel to the State of Nebraska as per the attached specifications for a one (1) year period from date of award. The contract may be renewed for two (2) additional three (3) month periods when mutually agreeable to the vendor and the State of Nebraska.

(ml 1/5/2018)

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL HWY92 E JCT 79AND92 MP438 5MI W of Weston	200.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	_____
2	DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL HWY 8 JCT 8 AND 65 PAWNEE CITY	1,000.0000	TN	<u>25.50</u>	<u>25,500</u>
3	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY275 AT 57 JCT 5MI N STANTON	2,000.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	_____
4	DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY24 MP5 5MI NW OF STANTON	1,200.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	_____

BIDDER MUST COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING

DISCOUNT PAYMENT TERMS: N/A % N/A DAYS

By signing this Invitation to Bid form, the bidder guarantees compliance with the provisions stated in this Invitation to Bid, agrees to the terms and conditions unless otherwise agreed to (see Section III) and certifies that bidder maintains a drug free work place environment. Vendor will furnish the items requested within 60 days after receipt of order. Failure to enter Delivery Date may cause quotation to be REJECTED.

Sign [Signature]
Here (Authorized Signature MANDATORY - MUST BE SIGNED IN INK)

Enter Contact Information Below

VENDOR# 2513091
VENDOR: BEATRICE SAND & GRAVEL
Address: 400 SCOTT STREET
BEATRICE, NE 68310

Contact JUSTIN WILLIAMS
Telephone (402) 729-2590
Facsimile _____
Email JUSTIN.W@NEBCOINC.COM

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	2 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
5	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL FULLERTON MAINT YARD	500.0000	TN	<i>NO BID</i>	
6	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ORD MAINT YARD	500.0000	TN		
7	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY39 MP21 1MI N OF GENOA	2,000.0000	TN		
8	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY14 MP106 7MI N OF FULLERTON	100.0000	TN		
9	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP78 1MI N OF ORD	700.0000	TN		
10	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY11 MP68 5MI S OF ORD	1,400.0000	TN		
11	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL ST PAUL MAINT YARD	1,000.0000	TN		
12	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL GREELEY YARD	300.0000	TN		
13	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY92 MP339 2MI W FARWELL JCT	500.0000	TN		
14	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP89 5MI S OF ST PAUL	700.0000	TN		
15	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP95 1MI N OF ST PAUL	700.0000	TN		
16	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP120 2MI N OF GREELEY	1,200.0000	TN		
17	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP125 7MI N OF GREELEY	1,200.0000	TN		
18	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY22 MP24 9MI E OF SCOTIA	500.0000	TN		
19	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL	1,280.0000	TN		

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	3 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
	HWY58 MP29 1MI N OF ROCKVILLE				
20	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP320 1MI W OF LOUP CITY	640.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
21	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	1,000.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
22	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL LOUP CITY YARD	600.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
23	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	400.0000	TN	<u>22.35</u>	<u>8,940</u>
24	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS	500.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
25	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP12 7MI N OF RED CLOUD	600.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
26	DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP7 2MI N OF RED CLOUD	1,420.0000	TN	<u>23.95</u>	<u>34,009</u>
27	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY281 MP5 S OF RED CLOUD	500.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
28	DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA	1,000.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
29	DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY34 MP247 3MI W AURORA	1,500.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
30	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL GERING MAINT YARD	1,000.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
31	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL JCT 92 AND 385 MP 65 7MI SE BRIDGEPORT	1,500.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
32	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL CRAWFORD MAINT YARD	1,000.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
33	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL HARRISON MAINT YARD	1,000.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	4 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
34	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL GORDON MAINTYARD	1,000.0000	TN	<i>NO BID</i>	
35	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL HEMINGFORD MAINT YARD	1,000.0000	TN		
36	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL ALLIANCE MAINT YARD	1,000.0000	TN		
37	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL CHAPPELL MAINT YARD	2,000.0000	TN		
38	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL KIMBALL MAINT YARD	2,000.0000	TN		
39	DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL SIDNEY MAINT YARD	2,000.0000	TN		
40	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL 17MI EAST WY LINE HWY88 MP17	2,000.0000	TN		
41	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL 28MI N SCOTTSBLUFF HWY71 MP90	1,500.0000	TN		
42	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL 2MI W SCOTTSBLUFF HWY92 MP19	1,500.0000	TN		
43	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL 1MI S OSHKOSH HWY27 MP118	2,000.0000	TN		
44	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL HWY26 MP41 JCT HWY 26 AND L62A 4MI NW of Bayard	2,000.0000	TN		
45	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL HWY 87 MP 56 1MI W RUSHVILLE	1,500.0000	TN		
46	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL 1MI W OF GORDON HWY20 MP105	3,500.0000	TN		
47	DIST 5 ARMOR GRAVEL 38MI S OF GORDON HWY27 MP183	2,500.0000	TN		

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	5 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
48	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY97 MP9 12MI NW NORTH PLATTE	2,000.0000	TN	<i>NO BID</i>	
49	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 23 MP 56 DICKENS	2,000.0000	TN		
50	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY30 MP103 7MI NW BIG SPRINGS	2,000.0000	TN		
51	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE W 14TH YARD	1,000.0000	TN		
52	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL NORTH PLATTE I80 YARD	1,000.0000	TN		
53	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL SUTHERLAND MAINT YARD	1,000.0000	TN		
54	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	750.0000	TN		
55	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ANSLEY HWY 183 MP89	500.0000	TN		
56	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ANSLEY MAINT YARD	1,500.0000	TN		
57	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL SARGENT YARD	750.0000	TN		
58	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL OCONTO MAINT YARD	1,500.0000	TN		
59	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OCONTO JCT HWY 21 AND 40	750.0000	TN		
60	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	375.0000	TN		
61	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251	1,500.0000	TN		
62	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257	750.0000	TN		

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	6 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
63	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68	750.0000	TN	<i>NO BID</i>	
64	DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	1,500.0000	TN		
65	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL BROKEN BOW WEST HWY2 MP277	500.0000	TN		
66	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ROSCOE HWY 30 MP 136	2,500.0000	TN		
67	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL OGALLALA HWY 26 MP 136	2,500.0000	TN		
68	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 26 MP 141 ESTRADAS	5,000.0000	TN		
69	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	1,980.0000	TN		
70	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 183 1MI W OF MULLEN	1,200.0000	TN		
71	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 92 MP 205 2MI E TYRON	660.0000	TN		
72	DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 92 MP 205 2MI E TYRON	1,200.0000	TN		
73	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 2 MP 144 2MI W HYANNIS	660.0000	TN		
74	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 83 MP 130 18MI N STAPLETON	660.0000	TN		
75	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 83 MP 127 12MI N STAPLETON	660.0000	TN		
76	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON	330.0000	TN		
77	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL	1,320.0000	TN		

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	7 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
	HWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN				
78	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 61 MP 126 1MI N ARTHUR	660.0000	TN	<i>NO BID</i>	
79	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 92 MP 175 11MI E ARTHUR	660.0000	TN		
80	DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 61 MP 131 7MI N ARTHUR	660.0000	TN		
81	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ALMA YARD 1004 10TH ST	2,000.0000	TN		
82	DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 136 MP 24 2MI E OF ORLEANS	680.0000	TN		
83	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 6 MP157 W EDGE OF HOLDREGE	2,500.0000	TN		
84	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 6 MP 181 E EDGE OF MINDEN	2,000.0000	TN		
85	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY17 MP4 13MI S OF CULBERTSON	900.0000	TN		
86	DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6 MP 118 1MI W OF HOLBROOK	1,700.0000	TN		
87	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL SPRINGVIEW YARD	1,400.0000	TN		
88	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL BASSETT PIT HWY 183 MP180	600.0000	TN		
89	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL BROCKSBURG PIT HWY 12 MP80	600.0000	TN		
90	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL BROCKSBURG HWY 12 MP 82 14MI W of NAPER	1,000.0000	TN		
91	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL BROCKSBURG HWY 12 MP 82	700.0000	TN		

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	8 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
	14MI W OF NAPER				
92	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 12 MP 102 2MI E NAPER	350.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	
93	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL SPENCER YARD	500.0000	TN		
94	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY281 MP212 2MI E OF SPENCER	310.0000	TN		
95	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 281 MP 202 19MI N ONEILL	3,000.0000	TN		
96	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL NAPER YARD	500.0000	TN		
97	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 20 MP286 2MI E OF ATKINSON	2,450.0000	TN		
98	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 20 MP297 2MI W OF EMMET	700.0000	TN		
99	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL ATKINSON YARD	2,000.0000	TN		
100	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ATKINSON SOUTH YARD	1,800.0000	TN		
101	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 11 MP106 13MI N BURWELL	2,500.0000	TN		
102	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL BURWELL SOUTH YARD	2,000.0000	TN		
103	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 183 MP143 26MI NW BURWELL	2,500.0000	TN		
104	DIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY 11 MP118 25MI N BURWELL	2,700.0000	TN		
105	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL VALENTINE YARD	2,500.0000	TN		

State of Nebraska - INVITATION TO BID CONTRACT

Return to:
State Purchasing Bureau
1526 K Street, Suite 130
Lincoln, Nebraska 68508

Telephone: 402-471-6500
Fax: 402-471-2089

Date	1/10/18	Page	9 of 9
Solicitation Number	5745 OF		
Opening Date and Time	02/14/18	2:00 pm	
Buyer	JULIE SCHILTZ (AS)		

DESTINATION OF GOODS
MULTIPLE DELIVERY LOCATIONS
PLEASE REFER TO DOCUMENTATION
FOR DELIVERY ADDRESSES.

INVITATION

Line	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Price
106	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL MERRIMAN YARD	2,000.0000	TN	<u>NO BID</u>	_____
107	DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL CODY YARD	750.0000	TN	_____	_____
108	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY20 MP202 5MI E OF VALENTINE	1,200.0000	TN	_____	_____
109	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 20 MP165 5MI E OF CODY	1,200.0000	TN	_____	_____
110	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY97 MP117 26MI S VALENTINE	300.0000	TN	_____	_____
111	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY12 MP28 2MI W OF NORDEN	300.0000	TN	_____	_____
112	DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL HWY 20 MP135 W OF MERRIMAN	600.0000	TN	_____	_____
113	OPTION 1:DELIVERY COST PER TON ARMOR COAT ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200.0000	TN	_____	_____
114	OPTION 2:DELIVERY COST PER TON DEICING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200.0000	TN	_____	_____
115	OPTION 3:DELIVERY COST PER TON WINDROW ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200.0000	TN	_____	_____
116	OPTION 4:DELIVERY COST PER TON SURFACING ALT/ADD LOCATIONS	200.0000	TN	_____	_____